
Item Description Size
Bob Barker 

Company
Charm-Tex Victory Supply

Small 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 11.99/dz

Medium 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 11.99/dz

Large 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 11.99/dz

X-Large 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 11.99/dz

2X-Large 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 12.12/dz

3X-Large 12.97/dz 14.90/dz 12.43/dz

4X-Large 12.97/dz 15.90/dz 12.43/dz 

5X-Large 12.97/dz 16.90/dz 12.84/dz

Medium 78/case of 100 72.90/case of 100 No Bid

Large 78/case of 101 72.90/case of 100 No Bid

X-Large 78/case of 102 72.90/case of 100 No Bid

2X-Large 78/case of 103 72.90/case of 100 No Bid

3X-Large 84/case of 100 84.90/case of 100 No Bid

4X-Large 84/case of 100 84.90/case of 100 No Bid

5 6.68/dz 9.90/dz 7.68/dz

6 6.68/dz 9.90/dz 7.68/dz

7 6.68/dz 9.90/dz 7.68/dz

8 6.68/dz 9.90/dz 7.68/dz

9 6.68/dz 11.36/dz 8.49/dz

10 7.94/dz 11.36/dz 8.49/dz

12 7.94/dz 13.90/dz 8.75/dz

13 7.94/dz 13.90/dz 8.75/dz

14 7.94/dz 15.54/dz 9.21/dz

15 9.94/dz 15.54/dz 9.21/dz

16 9.94/dz 15.54/dz 9.21/dz

Small 42.32/dz $159.90 No Bid

Medium 42.32/dz $169.90 No Bid

Large 42.32/dz $179.90 No Bid

X-Large 42.32/dz $189.90 No Bid

2X-Large 42.32/dz $199.80 No Bid

3X-Large No Bid $109.90 No Bid

32   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 22.90/dz 17.46/dz

34   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 22.90/dz 17.46/dz

36   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 22.90/dz 17.46/dz

38   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 22.90/dz 17.46/dz

40   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 22.90/dz 18.55/dz

42   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 23.90/dz 18.55/dz

44   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 23.90/dz 22.57/dz

46   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 24.90/dz 22.57/dz

48   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 24.90/dz 22.57/dz

50   A,B,C,D 16.55/dz 25.90/dz 23.19/dz
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MEN'S BOXERS

*50% Cotton/50% Polyester

*Color - must be white

*Fruit of the Loom or approved equal

*Estimated # purchased per year: 30,000

BRAS

*50% Cotton/50% Polyester blend

*Pull over

*NO snaps, hooks, eyes, or under wire

*Color – must be white

*Playtex brand or approved equal

*Estimated # purchased per year: 10,000

WOMEN'S PANTIES, DISPOSABLE

*Polypropylene or nylon construction

MEN'S BOXERS, DISPOSABLE

*Polypropylene or nylon construction

WOMEN'S PANTIES

*100% Cotton

*Color – must be white

*Hanes brand or approved equal

*Estimated # purchased per year: 10,000

IFB No. 2024-0084-CORR/APS Inmate Clothing, Hygiene, Linen & Mattresses
Bid Abstract Sheet



Shoe Size 8 - 12 4.85/dz 5.96/dz 5.54/dz

Shoe Size 13-16 6.90/dz 6.96/dz 5.54dz

Small 15.65/ea 15.18/ea 14.24/ea

Medium 15.65/ea 15.18/ea 14.24/ea

Large 15.65/ea 15.18/ea 14.24/ea

X-Large 15.65/ea 15.54/ea 14.24/ea

2X-Large 15.65/ea 15.54/ea 14.24/ea

3X-Large 15.65/ea 15.90/ea 14.92/ea

4X-Large 15.65/ea 16.54/ea 14.92/ea

5X-Large 15.65/ea 17.54/ea 15.60/ea

6X-Large 15.65/ea 17.54/ea 15.60/ea

7X-Large 16.94/es 18.90/ea 16.16/ea

8X-Large 18.94/ea 18.90/ea 16.16/ea

9X-Large 18.94/ea 19.90/ea 16.16/ea

10X-Large 18.94/ea 19.90/ea 16.16/ea

Small 5.89/ea 6.54/ea 6.04/ea

Medium 5.89/ea 6.54/ea 6.04/ea

Large 5.89/ea 6.54/ea 6.04/ea

X-Large 5.99/ea 6.54/ea 6.04/ea

2X-Large 6.39/ea 6.54/ea 6.04/ea

3X-Large 6.39/ea 6.90/ea 6.34/ea

4X-Large 7.39/ea 7.54/ea 6.66/ea

5X-Large 7.39/ea 7.72/ea 6.97/ea

6X-Large 7.39/ea 7.90/ea 7.28/ea

7X-Large 9.39/ea 8.54/ea 7.59/ea

8X-Large 9.69/ea 8.90/ea 7.91/ea

9X-Large 9.69/ea 8.90/ea 8.22/ea

10X-Large 9.69/ea 8.90/ea 8.43/ea

Small 7.59/ea 6.72/ea 6.14/ea

Medium 7.59/ea 6.72/ea 6.14/ea

Large 7.59/ea 6.72/ea 6.14/ea

X-Large 7.59/ea 6.72/ea 6.14/ea

2X-Large 7.59/ea 6.72/ea 6.14/ea

3X-Large 7.99/ea 6.90/ea 6.47/ea

4X-Large 7.99/ea 7.54/ea 6.81/ea

5X-Large 8.49/ea 7.90/ea 7.14/ea

6X-Large 8.49/ea 8.18/ea 7.49/ea

7X-Large 9.89/ea 8.54/ea 8.32/ea

8X-Large 9.89/ea 8.90/ea 8.65/ea

9X-Large 10.99/ea 9.54/ea 8.99/ea

10X-Large 10.99/ea 9.54/ea 9.33/ea

6

7

8

9

SOCKS

*50% Cotton/50% Polyester blend

*Unisex

*Ankle-length

*Fruit of the Loom or approved equal

*Color: White

*Estimated # purchased per year: 30,000 pair

COVERALL

*Fabric to be perma-press

*65% Polyester/35% Cotton twill

*Heavy duty snaps (grippers not acceptable)

*One pocket only over left breast, no opening in 

side seams

*Colors:  Orange, Khaki, Yellow, Navy, Red and 

Dark Brown 

*Short sleeve, full cut, double stitched, reinforced 

at points of strain

*Screen print:  Each shall have "SFCADF"  in 5- 

inch high black letters on backside of coverall

*Estimated # purchased per year: 2,000

UNIFORM SHIRT

*Fabric to be perma-press

*65% Polyester/35% Cotton twill

*One pocket only over left breast, no opening in 

side seams

*Colors: Orange, Khaki, Yellow, Navy, Red and 

Dark Brown 

*Short sleeve, full cut, double stitched, reinforced 

at points of strain

*Screen print:  Each shall have "SFCADF"  in 5- 

inch high black letters on backside of shirt

*Estimated # purchased per year: 2,000

UNIFORM TROUSERS

*Fabric to be perma-press

*65% Polyester/35% Cotton twill

*NO pockets

*Hemmed bottoms

*Elastic waistband

*Colors: Orange, Khaki, Yellow, Navy, Red and 

Dark Brown 

*Estimated # purchased per year: 2,000



42/44 20.53/ea $20.90 18.92/ea

46/48 20.53/ea $20.90 18.92/ea

50/52 20.53/ea $19.90 18.92/ea

54/56 20.53/ea $20.90 21.93/ea

58/60 20.53/ea $21.90 21.93/ea

66/68 20.53/ea $22.90 21.93/ea

70/72 20.53/ea $23.90 21.93/ea

74/76 20.53/ea $24.90 21.93/ea

6 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

7 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

8 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

9 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

10 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

11 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

12 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

13 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

14 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

15 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

16 2.59/pair 2.84/pair 1.97/ea

6 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

7 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

8 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

9 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

10 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

11 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

12 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

13 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

14 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

15 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

16 3.23/pair 3.89/pair 3.78/ea

4 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 6 14.99/ea

5 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 6 14.99/ea

6 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 8 14.99/ea

7 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 9 14.99/ea

8 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 10 14.99/ea

9 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 11 14.99/ea

10 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 12 14.99/ea

11 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 13 14.99/ea

12 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 14 14.99/ea

13 18.21/pair 118.90/case of 15 14.99/ea
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KITCHEN BOOTS

*100% Waterproof

*Seamless molded construction

*Non-slip

*Reinforced construction at critical stress points

*Estimated # purchased per year: 25 pair

EVA STEP IN DECK SHOE

*Lightweight

*Strapless

*Non-skid

*Non-marking

*Estimated # purchased per year: 200 pair

SLIP ON PVC SANDAL

*Unisex

*One piece “basket-weave” look

*Non-skid

*Non-marking

*Color: Orange

*Estimated # purchased per year: 100 pair

WINTER WORK JACKET

*Blanket lined

*Acrylic/Polyester or Denim Outer Shell

*Colors: Blue, Khaki

*Screen print:  Each shall have "SFCADF" in 5- 

inch high black letters on backside of jacket

*Estimated # purchased per year: 200



14

SHAMPOO

*2.0 - 2.5oz

*Clear formula

*Clear plastic container

*Estimated # purchased per year: 12,000

21.32/case of 96 $29.90 No Bid

15

FACE/BODY BAR SOAP

*1.5 - 2.0oz bar

*Estimated # purchased per year: 12,000

51.29/case of 500 68.90/case of 500 No Bid

16

RAZOR

*Anti-Shank - break away when tampered with

*Clear

*Thumb-style

*Estimated # purchased per year: 12,000

39.59/case of 500 99.90/case of 500 No Bid

17

TOOTHBRUSH

*Max size: 3.5 inch long

*Estimated # purchased per year: 55,000

5.81/case of 144 6.90/case of 144 No Bid

18

TOOTHPASTE

*.85

*Clear gel

*Clear plastic tube

*Estimated # purchased per year: 75,000

22.41/case of 144 24.90/case of 144 No Bid

19

DEODORANT

*0.5oz

*Scent free

*Push-up container

*Estimated # purchased per year: 12,000

42.65/case of 144 52.90/case of 144 No Bid

20

SANITARY NAPKIN

*Feminine Hygiene

*Individually wrapped

*Estimated # purchased per year: 110,000

26.65/case of 500 56.90/case of 864 No Bid

21

WASH CLOTH

*100% Cotton

*12" x 12"

*Flame Retardant

*Securely stitched hem

*Estimated # purchased per year: 2,000

1.77/dz $2.88 2.48/dz

22

BATH TOWEL

*100% Cotton

*22" x 44"

*Flame Retardant

*Securely stitched hem

*Estimated # purchased per year: 3,000

12.65/dz 14.90/dz 11.78/dz

23

BED SHEET

*55% Polyester/45% Cotton

*54" x 90"

*180 Thread count

*No iron

*Securely stitched hem

*Flame retardant

*Color: White

*Estimated # purchased per year: 2,000

39.62/dz 41.90/dz 24.19/dz

24

PILLOW CASE

*50% Polyester/50% cotton

*42" x 36"

*180 Thread count

*No iron

*Securely stitched hem

*Flame retardant

*Color: White

*Estimated # purchased per year: 120

13.92/dz 13.54/dz 9.98/dz

25

BLANKET

*No Wool

*58" x 88"

*Whipstitched ends

*Flame retardant

*Estimated # purchased per year: 120

101.40/case of 24 72.54/dz 5.37/ea

26

PILLOW

*Flame resistant

*20" x 26"

*Micro-Guard Cover to kill bacteria and prevent 

from spreading

*Antimicrobial polyester fiberfill

*Easy to clean with soap and water

*Estimated # purchased per year: 100

8.21/ea 74.88/dz No Bid



DERBY MATTRESS OR EQUIVALENT

*Description: Envelope style, with pillow. 100% 

sealed seam, Dartex fabric cover that is warranted 

to not crack for up to 5 years; fluid resistant 

breathable vent.  Flame retardant mattress suitable 

for continuous use in correctional environments. If 

mattress is equivalent specify mattress type. 

Materials: (must include)

a.        Cover must be Dartex Coatings, 

Inc. PU coated fabric, ISO certified

b.       5 year warranty against cracking, 

dimensional stability

c.        Flame retardant

d.       Anti-fungal

e.        Anti-microbial

f.        Bacteriostatic

g.       Virus barrier

h.       Moisture vapor permeable

i.         Washable

j.         Abrasive resistant

Construction: (must include)

a.        100% sealed seam with no 

stitching

b.       Breathable vend, must resist 

water, oil, urine, blood and head lice
c.        Seam strength in excess of 70 

lbs.
d.       Core must be 100% densified 

polyester, minimum of 12 oz/sq ft. 

density

e.        Envelope style construction, 

turned edge construction with all 

seams inside the mattress

f.        Thickness no less that 4.5”

g.       Size:  4.5 x 25 x 75

(must meet the following tests)

Flammability and ASTM testing must meet or 

exceed the requirements of the following:
a.        California Technical Bulletin 

117
b.       California Technical Bulletin 121
c.        California Technical Bulletin 

129
d.       California Technical Bulletin 133
e.        California Technical Bulletin 

603
f.        ASTM E 162-95 Flame Spread 

Test

g.       ASTM D 2863-00 (Oxygen 

index) Procedure “A”
h.       ASTM E 662 Smoke Density 

Test
i.         Consumer Product Safety 

Commission, 16 CFR 1632, Standard 

for the Flammability of Mattresses 

and Mattress Pads
j.         Clean ability Standard DS 

#7566
Life Cycle Test: Must pass rotator test of 100,000 

cycles with minimum loss of density and no cover 

damage.

Test Reports:

Where products, materials and procedures are 

specified by reference to specific tests or standards, 

bidders must submit 2 copies of certificates from an 

independent testing laboratory showing satisfactory 

completion of specified tests and conformance to 

standards.

*Estimated # purchased per year: 100

27 104.96ea No Bid114.90/ea



28

MATTRESS MENDING PATCHES

*Clear, water-resistant tear patch

*Estimated # purchased per year: 50

2.80/ea 29.90/case of 5 No Bid

29

SMALL LAUNDRY BAG

*White

*24" x 36"

*100% Polyester Mesh

*Thickness: 0.040"

*Must be durable and resistant to detergent 

breakdown

*NO Tie Cord

*Estimated # purchased per year: 200

32.22/dz 29.90/dz No Bid

30

LARGE LAUNDRY BAG

*White

*30" x 48"

*100% Polyester Mesh

*Thickness: 0.040"

*Must be durable and resistant to detergent 

breakdown

*NO Tie Cord

*Estimated # purchased per year: 100

40.35/dz 49.90/dz No Bid

31

SMALL DISPOSABLE PROPERTY BAG

*Clear plastic

*9" x 12"

*Self-Sealing

*Tamper-evident

*Serial/control-numbered with receipt

56.51/case of 200 39.90/case of 200 No Bid

32

LARGE DISPOSABLE PROPERTY BAG

*Clear plastic

*14" x 24"

*Self-Sealing

*Tamper-evident

*Serial/control-numbered with receipt

88.98/case of 200 46.90/case of 100 No Bid

33

MESH IN-CELL STORAGE BOX

*Hook and loop top

*24" x 16" x 12"

*Vinyl reinforced

*Reinforced handles

12.10/ea 13.18/ea 14.89/ea




