



**SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET**

BID OPENING: October 22, 2019 at 2:00 PM (MST)

INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0004-PW/MAM "Purchase & Delivery Reflective Sign & Pavement Marking Material"

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *Trunkce Romero*

WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion *[Signature]*

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS		
							Bid Items	Bid Items	Bid Items
Ozark Materials, LLC 591 Glendale Ave. Greenville, AL 36037	✓	N/A	✓	✓	✓	✓	1 No bid	24 \$ 193.11/ea	47 \$ 193.11/ea
							2 No bid	25 \$ 29.11/ea	48 \$ 42.20/gal
							3 No bid	26 \$ 109.88/ea	49 \$ 2.73/sq
							4 No bid	27 \$ 100.45/ea	50 \$ 1.50/sq
							5 No bid	28 \$ 103.32/ea	51 \$ 2.73/sq
							6 No bid	29 \$ 139.81/ea	52 \$ 1.50/sq
							7 No bid	30 \$ 83.28/ea	53 \$ 395.00/e
							8 No bid	31 \$ 106.19/ea	54 No bid
							9 No bid	32 \$ 139.81/ea	55 No bid
							10 No bid	33 \$ 100.45/ea	56 No bid
							11 No bid	34 \$ 83.23/ea	57 No bid
							12 No bid	35 \$ 29.52/ea	58 No bid
							13 No bid	36 \$ 61.30/ea	59 No bid
							14 No bid	37 \$ 123.82/ea	60 No bid
							15 No bid	38 \$ 123.82/ea	61 No bid
							16 No bid	39 \$ 4.95/sq	62 No bid
							17 No bid	40 \$ 1.73/sq	63 No bid
							18 No bid	41 \$ 103.82/ea	64 No bid
							19 \$ 60.89/ea	42 \$ 46.49/ea	65 No bid
							20 \$ 70.32/ea	43 \$ 67.73/ea	66 No bid
							21 \$ 101.68/ea	44 \$ 80.30/ea	67 No bid
							22 \$ 157.03/ea	45 \$ 88.54/ea	68 No bid
							23 \$ 100.86/ea	46 \$ 29.11/ea	69 No bid

**SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET**

BID OPENING: October 22, 2019 at 2:00 PM (MST)  
 INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0004-PW/MAM "Purchase & Delivery Reflective Sign & Pavement Marking Material"  
 DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *Paula Romero*

WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion *[Signature]*

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS								
							Bid Items			Bid Items			Bid Items		
Osburn Associates Inc. 11931 State Route 93N Logan, OH 43138-9313	✓	N/A	—	—	<del>38</del> ✓	✓	1	\$ 0.98	24	\$ 706.20	47	\$ 706.05			
							2	\$ 0.96	25	\$ 187.50	48	no bid			
							3	\$ 1.56	26	no bid	49	no bid			
							4	\$ 0.66	27	no bid	50	no bid			
							5	\$ 1.21	28	no bid	51	no bid			
							6	\$ 2.34	29	no bid	52	no bid			
							7	\$ 2.45	30	no bid	53	no bid			
							8	\$ 2.28	31	\$ 323.40	54	no bid			
							9	\$ 2.28	32	no bid	55	no bid			
							10	\$ 2.39	33	no bid	56	\$ 3.23			
							11	\$ 2.28	34	no bid	57	\$ 2.38			
							12	\$ 2.92	35	no bid	58	\$ 788.80			
							13	\$ 3.02	36	\$ 576.40	59	\$ 1,138.50			
							14	\$ 3.02	37	\$ 576.40	60	no bid			
							15	\$ 1.56	38	no bid	61	\$ 748.10			
							16	\$ 0.29	39	\$ 3.94	62	\$ 519.20			
							17	\$ 0.29	40	no bid	63	\$ 915.20			
							18	\$ 4.27	41	\$ 201.35	64	\$ 273.91			
							19	\$ 475.88	42	no bid	65	no bid			
							20	\$ 663.31	43	no bid	66	no bid			
							21	\$ 533.50	44	no bid	67	no bid			
							22	\$ 460.94	45	no bid	68	\$ 1,041.30			
							23	\$ 331.16	46	no bid	69	\$ 1,091.90			

**SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET**

BID OPENING: October 22, 2019 at 2:00 PM (MST)

INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0004-PW/MAM "Purchase & Delivery Reflective Sign & Pavement Marking Material"

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *Frankie Romero*

WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion *[Signature]*

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS					
							Bid Items		Bid Items		Bid Items	
Cheryl Dennison 75420 N. Natchez Ave. Niles, IL 60714	✓	N/A	-	✓	✓	✓	1	\$ 0.52	24	No bid	47	No bid
							2	\$ 0.61	25	No bid	48	
							3	\$ 1.20	26	No bid	49	
							4	\$ 1.20	27	No bid	50	
							5	\$ 0.75	28	No bid	51	
							6	\$ 1.15	29	No bid	52	
							7	\$ 1.30	30	No bid	53	
							8	\$ 1.25	31	No bid	54	
							9	\$ 1.45	32	No bid	55	
							10	\$ 1.50	33	No bid	56	
							11	\$ 1.50	34	No bid	57	
							12	\$ 1.74	35	No bid	58	
							13	\$ 1.74	36		59	
							14	\$ 1.74	37		60	
							15	\$ 1.25	38		61	
							16	\$ 0.14	39		62	
							17	\$ 0.14	40		63	
							18	No bid	41		64	
							19	No bid	42		65	
							20	No bid	43		66	
							21	No bid	44		67	
							22	No bid	45		68	
							23	No bid	46		69	

**SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET**

BID OPENING: October 22, 2019 at 2:00 PM (MST)  
 INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0004-PW/MAM "Purchase & Delivery Reflective Sign & Pavement Marking Material"  
 DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *Trinidad Romero* WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion *[Signature]*

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS								
							Bid Items			Bid Items			Bid Items		
							1	2	3	24	25	26	47	48	49
3M Maplewood 3M Center Maplewood, MN 55144	✓	N/A	-	-	✓	✓	1	\$0.51 / \$0.12	24	\$629.34	47	\$629.34			
							2	\$0.65	25	\$85.22	48	\$58.56 / \$66			
							3	\$1.21	26	\$150.78	49	No bid			
							4	\$1.21	27	\$150.78	50	No bid			
							5	\$0.73	28	\$173.32	51	No bid			
							6	\$1.30	29	\$354.00	52	No bid			
							7	\$1.30	30	\$129.99	53	No bid			
							8	\$1.30	31	\$294.99	54	\$6.07 / \$7.81			
							9	\$1.30	32	\$259.98	55	\$7.81 / \$9.54			
							10	\$1.30	33	\$173.32	56	\$1.01			
							11	\$1.79	34	\$129.99	57	\$1.01			
							12	\$1.79	35	\$43.33	58	\$177.00			
							13	\$1.79	36	\$357.28	59	\$258.95			
							14	\$1.79	37	\$262.22	60	\$416.28			
							15	\$1.47	38	\$287.28 / \$36	61	\$681.77			
							16	\$0.14	39	\$3.63	62	\$472.00			
							17	\$0.25	40	\$3.63	63	\$819.44			
							18	\$2.15	41	\$281.88	64	\$124.55			
							19	\$108.12	42	\$91.77	65	\$258.95			
							20	\$150.78	43	\$147.50	66	\$258.95			
							21	\$242.65	44	\$173.32	67	\$190.12			
							22	\$419.55	45	\$129.99	68	\$583.44			
							23	\$301.56	46	\$72.11	69	\$629.35			