

SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET

BID OPENING: November 6, 2018

INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0286-PW/mam "Purchase and Delivery of Signs, Aluminum Blanks & Historic Markers"

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY:

Keith [Signature]

WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion

[Signature]

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	ADDENDA		BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS			
	#1	#2							Bid Items	Bid Items		
Osburn Associates, Inc. 11931 State Route 93 N Logan, OH 43138-9313	✓	✓	✓	N/A			✓	✓	1	6.58	24	6.10
									2	8.15	25	NO BID
									3	6.91	26	NO BID
									4	7.64	27	NO BID
									5	9.86	28	NO BID
									6	6.91	29	NO BID
									7	7.64	30	NO BID
									8	9.86	31	NO BID
									9	7.02	32	NO BID
									10	7.75	33	NO BID
									11	9.97		
									12	7.02		
									13	7.75		
									14	9.97		
									15	9.97		
									16	1.54		
									17	1.54		
									18	16.98		
									19	16.98		
									20	16.98		
									21	14.76		
									22	9.96		
									23	3.88		

SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET

BID OPENING: November 6, 2018
 INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0286-PW/mam "Purchase and Delivery of Signs, Aluminum Blanks & Historic Markers"
 DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *[Signature]* WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion *[Signature]*

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS	ADDENDA		BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	BID SHEETS			
	#1	#2							Bid Items	Bid Items		
Interwest Safety Supply, LLC 5821 Coronado Ave, NE Albuquerque, NM 87109	#1	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	✓	N/A			✓	✓	1	6.25	24	4.30
	#2	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>							2	8.50	25	NO BID
	3	7.50							26	NO BID		
	4	8.45							27	NO BID		
	5	9.65							28	NO BID		
	6	8.35							29	NO BID		
	7	9.30							30	NO BID		
	8	9.85							31	NO BID		
	9	7.50							32	NO BID		
	10	8.45							33	NO BID		
	11	9.65										
	12	8.35										
	13	9.30										
	14	9.85										
	15	10.25										
	16	2.25										
	17	2.25										
	18	9.35										
	19	11.85/12.75										
	20	9.90/11.25										
	21	9.90/11.25										
	22	9.90/11.25										
	23	3.80/										

11.25

SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET		BID OPENING: November 6, 2018		INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0286-PW/mam "Purchase and Delivery of Signs, Aluminum Blanks & Historic Markers"		DEPARTMENT: Public Works		RECORDED BY: <i>Kath [Signature]</i>		WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmion <i>[Signature]</i>	
BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS		ADDENDA		BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	Three References	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	Bid Items Bid Items BID SHEETS BID SHEETS	
Austin Recd 3116 S. MSL AVE. Tempe, AZ 85282 - 3616		#1	#2							1	6.50
										2	6.95
										3	7.10
										4	7.60
										5	8.10
										6	7.40
										7	7.90
										8	8.30
										9	7.50
										10	8.00
										11	8.40
										12	7.80
										13	8.30
										14	8.70
										15	9.50
										16	1.45
										17	1.45
										18	8.30
										19	8.90
										20	13.50
										21	13.50
										22	14.50
										23	3.60

SANTA FE COUNTY ABSTRACT SHEET

BID OPENING: November 6, 2018

INVITATION FOR BID #2019-0286-PW/mam "Purchase and Delivery of Signs, Aluminum Blanks & Historic Markers"

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

RECORDED BY: *[Signature]*

WITNESSED BY: Michelle A. Marmon

BIDDER NAME & ADDRESS		ADDENDA	BID FORM	Resident Preference	Business License	References Three	Bid Security	Campaign Disclosure Form	Bid Items	Bid SHEETS
Highway Supply Co. NE 6221 Chappell Rd. NE Albuquerque, NM 87113		#1 K		N/A			✓	✓	14.5015	12.35
		#2 K							18.35	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
									13.40	NO BID
									15.50	NO BID
									19.80	NO BID
									13.00	NO BID
									15.35	NO BID
									19.55	NO BID
				</						