Change Order

No. 002
Date of Issuance: Effective Date:
Project: SF River Restoration  |Owner: SANTA FE COUNTY |Owner's Contract No.: 2013-0145-OS/PL
LR 62 to San Ysidro Crossine
Contract: Date of Contract: 10/18/12
Contractor: Meridian Contracting Engineer's Project No.:

The Contract Documents are modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:

Description:
Add extra work: Rubble and Trash Removal, Sort, Haul, Dispose 1000 tons @ $146.17 per ton

Attachments (list documents supporting change):
Work Change Directive 1

CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE: CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES:
Original Contract Price: (Excluding GRT) Original Contract Times: Working days [_] Calendar days
Substantial completion (days or date): 150
$1,185,578.00 Ready for final payment (days or date): 180
Increase from previously approved Change Increase from previously approved Change Orders
Orders No. 1 to No. 1: No. 1toNo. 1:
Substantial completion (days): 4
$11,756.86 Ready for final payment (days): 4
Contract Price prior to this Change Order: Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial completion (days or date): 154
$1,197,334.86 Ready for final payment (days or date): 184
Increase of this Change Order: Increase of this Change Order:
Substantial completion (days or date): 20
$146,170.00 Ready for final payment (days or date): 20

Contract Price incorporating this Change Order: Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:
Substantial completion (days or date): 174

$1,343,504.86 Ready for final payment (days or date): 204
RECOMMENDED: ) ‘ ACCE;%ED: ’ s ACCEPTED
By Mosn b 2/a¢/1> gy (Bul™. ' By

Project Manager (Authorized Owner (Authorized Signaturg) /o

Date: B Date:  2)ap g%
Approved by Fund ng Agency (if applicable): n/a ! :

Prepared by the Engineers Joint Contract Documents Commlttee ami endorsed
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Mgghan M. Bayer

From: Nolan Phillips [n.phillips @ meridiancon.net]
Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2013 7:47 AM

To: Meghan M. Bayer

Subject: RE: working days

Meghan,

To finish the additional work, | will need 20 working days. This will cover the time that was lost when the rubble was
discovered as well as provide me with time to sort, screen, and hau! the estimated 1000 TNS.

Sorry for the lateness of my reply.

Nolan J. Phillips, EI
Meridian Contracting, Inc.
Cell: 520-260-0021

From: Meghan M. Bayer [mailto:mbayer@co.santa-fe.nm.us]
Sent: Monday, February 11, 2013 5:43 PM

To: Nolan Phillips

Subject: working days

Hi Nolan -

Just a reminder, can you please send me an email with the number of additional working days needed to remove and
dispose 1,000 tons of the rubble and debris?

I want to include this as back up on the change order paperwork for Roberta.

Thanks, Meghan

Meghan Bayer

Open Space and Trails Project Manager
Projects, Facilities & Open Space Division
Public Works Department

Santa Fe County

PO Box 276, Santa Fe, NM 87504

Phone: 505.992.9878

Fax: 505.992.9869



